

July 28, 2020
Seward County Board of Equalization

State of Nebraska)
County of Seward) ss.

A regular meeting of the Seward County Board of Equalization was convened in open and public session at 8:30 a.m. on July 28, 2020 in the Commissioner's room at the Seward County Courthouse. Notice of the meeting was posted on the Courthouse bulletin board and on the Commissioner's Room door. The agenda for all meetings is kept continually current and is available for public inspection at the County Clerk's Office during normal business hours. The agenda is held open until one business day prior to the meeting for appearance before the Board. The Board of Equalization has the right to modify the agenda to include items of an emergency nature only at such public meeting.

The Seward County Board of Equalization convened on July 28, 2020 at 8:30 a.m.

Present: Chairperson: John Culver
Members: Mike Mundhenke, Bob Vrbka, Ken Schmieding, Becky Paulsen
County Clerk: Sherry Schweitzer
County Assessor: Marilyn Hladky

The Chairperson noted that the public meeting information is posted as required by law and available for public distribution if requested.

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited.

Moved by Paulsen and seconded by Vrbka to approve the minutes of July 21, 2020.

Affirmative Vote: Paulsen, Vrbka, Schmieding, Mundhenke, Culver Motion Carried

Hladky updated the Commissioners on her office activities.

Known items on the agenda for Board of Equalization on August 11, 2020 are as follows:

8:30 a.m.

1. Convene and announce Open Meetings Law
2. Pledge of Allegiance
3. Discuss/Action - Approve minutes of July 28, 2020
4. Discuss/Action – Assessor Information Update

Moved by Mundhenke and seconded by Schmieding to adjourn at 9:00 a.m.

Affirmative Vote: Mundhenke, Schmieding, Vrbka, Paulsen, Culver Motion Carried

State of Nebraska)
County of Seward) ss.

I, Sherry Schweitzer, the undersigned County Clerk of Seward County, Nebraska do hereby certify the foregoing minutes are true and are part of the official records of this office.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal this 11th day of August 2020.

County Clerk

Chairperson

July 28, 2020

Seward County Board of Commissioners

State of Nebraska)
County of Seward) ss.

A regular meeting of the Seward County Board of Commissioners was convened in open and public session at 9:00 a.m. on July 28, 2020 in the Commissioner's room at the Seward County Courthouse. Notice of the meeting was posted on the Courthouse bulletin board and on the Commissioner's Room door. The agenda for all meetings is kept continually current and is available for public inspection at the County Clerk's Office during normal business hours. The agenda is held open until one business day prior to the meeting for appearance before the Board. The Board of Commissioners has the right to modify the agenda to include items of an emergency nature only at such public meeting.

The Seward County Board of Commissioners convened on July 28, 2020 at 9:00 a.m.

Present: Chairperson: John Culver
Members: Mike Mundhenke, Bob Vrbka, Ken Schmieding, Becky Paulsen,
County Clerk: Sherry Schweitzer

The Chairperson noted that the public meeting information is posted as required by law and available for public distribution if requested.

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited.

Moved by Vrbka and seconded by Mundhenke to approve the minutes of July 21, 2020.
Affirmative Vote: Vrbka, Mundhenke, Paulsen, Schmieding, Culver Motion Carried

Sherry Schweitzer, County Clerk, updated the Commissioners on activities of her office.

Marilyn Hladky, Assessor, submitted the Assessor's 3 Year Plan of Assessment for the Commissioners' consideration.

Moved by Paulsen and seconded by Vrbka to accept the Seward County Assessor's 3 Year Plan of Assessment.
Affirmative Vote: Paulsen, Vrbka, Mundhenke, Schmieding, Culver Motion Carried

Moved by Vrbka and seconded by Mundhenke to accept the County Assessor's Cemetery Report as provided by the Seward County Assessor.
Affirmative Vote: Vrbka, Mundhenke, Paulsen, Schmieding, Culver Motion Carried

The Commissioners recessed at 9:15 a.m.
The Commissioners reconvened at 9:21 a.m.

Moved by Paulsen and seconded by Vrbka to go into Executive Session at 9:22 a.m. to discuss Potential Litigation.
Affirmative Vote: Paulsen, Vrbka, Mundhenke, Schmieding, Culver Motion Carried

Chairman Culver stated the Executive Session is for Potential Litigation.

Moved by Vrbka and seconded by Paulsen to go out of Executive Session at 9:48 a.m.
Affirmative Vote: Vrbka, Paulsen, Schmieding, Mundhenke, Culver Motion Carried

Chairman Culver stated that potential litigation had been discussed and no action was taken.

Terry Wicht, Highway Supt., was present to discuss awarding the bids for culverts, rock and gravel.

Moved by Paulsen and seconded by Schmieding to accept all bids for culverts as follows:

2020 Seward County Culvert Bids

2-2/3" x 1/2" RIVETED

Size	Gage	<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price Per foot	<u>M.C.I</u> Price Per foot	<u>Contech</u> Price Per foot	<u>Midwest</u> Price Per foot
18"	16	\$ 13.30	\$ 13.23	\$ 15.02	\$ 17.57
24"	16	\$ 17.70	\$ 17.71	\$ 18.65	\$ 22.26
30"	14	\$ 27.00	\$ 26.95	\$ 28.50	\$ 35.14
36"	14	\$ 32.25	\$ 32.14	\$ 36.04	\$ 42.18
42"	12	\$ 52.25	\$ 52.28	\$ 47.88	\$ 66.78
48"	12	\$ 59.50	\$ 59.56	\$ 61.10	\$ 76.15
54"	12	\$ 67.80	\$ 67.90	\$ 76.65	\$ 85.52
60"	10	\$ 95.00	\$ 94.56	\$ 92.70	\$ 120.67
72"	10	\$ 112.80	\$ 112.90	\$ 113.16	\$ 133.56

21x15	16	\$ 15.35	\$ 14.03	\$ 15.75	\$ 19.49
28x20	16	\$ 19.70	\$ 18.91	\$ 19.60	\$ 24.68
35x24	14	\$ 29.00	\$ 28.13	\$ 30.00	\$ 38.97
42x29	14	\$ 34.25	\$ 33.52	\$ 37.45	\$ 46.77
49x33	12	\$ 55.25	\$ 53.84	\$ 50.16	\$ 74.05
57x58	12	\$ 61.50	\$ 61.21	\$ 63.70	\$ 84.45
64x43	12	\$ 70.80	\$ 69.74	\$ 79.60	\$ 94.84
71x47	10	\$ 100.00	\$ 96.58	\$ 96.80	\$ 133.82
83x57	8	\$ 136.80	\$ 143.42	\$ 162.60	\$ 148.11

<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price 1' band	<u>M.C.I</u> Price 1' band	<u>Contech</u> Price 1' band	<u>Midwest</u> Price 1' band
\$ 26.60	\$ 19.85	\$ 23.85	\$ 17.57
\$ 35.40	\$ 26.57	\$ 29.70	\$ 22.26
\$ 54.00	\$ 40.43	\$ 34.45	\$ 28.11
\$ 64.50	\$ 48.21	\$ 43.45	\$ 33.97
\$ 104.50	\$ 78.42	\$ 54.25	No Bid
\$ 119.00	\$ 89.34	\$ 62.10	No Bid
\$ 135.60	\$ 101.85	\$151.25	No Bid
\$ 190.00	\$ 141.84	\$158.00	No Bid
\$ 225.60	\$ 169.35	\$197.25	No Bid

\$ 30.70	\$ 21.05	\$ 26.25	\$ 20.36
\$ 39.40	\$ 28.37	\$ 32.67	\$ 25.79
\$ 58.00	\$ 42.20	\$ 37.90	\$ 32.57
\$ 68.50	\$ 50.28	\$ 47.58	\$ 39.36
\$ 110.50	\$ 80.76	\$ 59.70	No Bid
\$ 123.00	\$ 91.82	\$ 68.30	No Bid
\$ 141.60	\$ 104.61	\$158.80	No Bid
\$ 200.00	\$ 144.87	\$165.90	No Bid
\$ 273.60	\$ 215.13	\$207.20	No Bid

<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price 2' band	<u>M.C.I</u> Price 2' band	<u>Contech</u> Price 2' band	<u>Midwest</u> Price 2' band
\$ 39.90	\$ 26.46	\$ 49.50	\$ 44.02
\$ 53.10	\$ 35.42	\$ 60.55	\$ 55.76
\$ 81.00	\$ 53.90	\$ 69.75	\$ 70.43
\$ 96.75	\$ 64.28	\$ 89.80	\$ 85.10
\$ 156.75	\$104.56	\$103.95	\$ 99.78
\$ 178.50	\$119.12	\$119.25	\$ 111.52
\$ 203.40	\$135.80	\$260.78	\$ 129.13
\$ 285.00	\$189.12	\$307.50	\$ 143.80
\$ 338.40	\$225.80	\$335.40	\$ 173.15

\$ 46.05	\$ 28.06	\$ 54.45	\$ 50.98
\$ 59.10	\$ 37.82	\$ 66.65	\$ 64.58
\$ 87.00	\$ 56.26	\$ 76.75	\$ 81.57
\$ 102.75	\$ 67.04	\$ 98.80	\$ 98.57
\$ 165.75	\$107.68	\$114.35	\$ 115.56
\$ 184.50	\$122.42	\$131.20	\$ 129.15
\$ 212.40	\$139.48	\$273.80	\$ 149.55
\$ 300.00	\$193.16	\$322.90	\$ 166.54
\$ 410.40	\$286.84	\$352.20	No Bid

2-2/3" x 1/2" HELICAL with recorrugated ends

Size	Gage	<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price Per foot	<u>M.C.I</u> Price Per foot	<u>Contech</u> Price Per foot	<u>Midwest</u> Price Per foot
18"	16	\$ 13.25	\$ 12.83	\$ 11.25	\$ 14.62
24"	16	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.18	\$ 14.50	\$ 18.51
30"	14	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.13	\$ 22.50	\$ 29.23
36"	14	\$ 32.80	\$ 31.16	\$ 27.40	\$ 35.08
42"	12	\$ 52.00	\$ 50.67	\$ 42.75	\$ 55.54
48"	12	\$ 60.00	\$ 57.72	\$ 48.75	\$ 63.33
54"	12	\$ 68.00	\$ 65.80	\$ 51.20	\$ 71.13
60"	10	\$ 92.00	\$ 91.61	\$ 66.95	\$ 100.36
72"	10	\$ 107.50	\$ 109.37	\$ 79.95	\$ 111.08

21x15	16	\$13.75	\$13.61	\$11.85	\$ 16.18
28x20	16	\$17.75	\$18.34	\$15.30	\$ 21.38
35x24	14	\$27.50	\$27.27	\$23.80	\$ 33.76
42x29	14	\$35.30	\$32.49	\$28.90	\$ 40.51
49x33	12	\$54.00	\$52.17	\$45.10	\$ 64.14
57x58	12	\$62.50	\$59.31	\$51.65	\$ 73.14
64x43	12	\$70.00	\$67.59	\$54.20	\$ 82.14
71x47	10	\$96.00	\$93.56	\$71.10	\$ 115.90
83x57	8	\$134.50	\$138.94	\$134.60	\$ 128.27

<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price 1' band	<u>M.C.I</u> Price 1' band	<u>Contech</u> Price 1' band	<u>Midwest</u> Price 1' band
\$ 26.50	\$ 19.25	\$ 23.85	\$ 17.57
\$ 34.00	\$ 25.77	\$ 29.70	\$ 22.26
\$ 53.00	\$ 39.20	\$ 34.45	\$ 28.12
\$ 65.60	\$ 46.74	\$ 43.45	\$ 33.98
\$ 104.00	\$ 76.01	\$ 54.25	No Bid
\$ 120.00	\$ 86.58	\$ 62.10	No Bid

\$ 136.00	\$ 98.70	\$151.25	No Bid
\$ 184.00	\$ 137.42	\$158.00	No Bid
\$ 215.00	\$ 164.06	\$197.25	No Bid

\$27.50	\$20.42	\$26.25	\$20.36
\$35.50	\$27.51	\$32.67	\$25.79
\$55.00	\$40.91	\$37.90	\$32.57
\$70.60	\$48.74	\$47.58	\$39.36
\$108.00	\$78.26	\$59.70	No Bid
\$125.00	\$88.97	\$68.30	No Bid
\$140.00	\$101.39	\$158.80	No Bid
\$192.00	\$140.34	\$165.90	No Bid
\$269.00	\$208.41	\$207.20	No Bid

<u>Ace/Eaton</u>	<u>M.C.I</u>	<u>Contech</u>	<u>Midwest</u>
Price	Price	Price	Price
<u>2' band</u>	<u>2' band</u>	<u>2' band</u>	<u>2' band</u>
\$ 39.75	\$ 25.66	\$ 49.50	\$ 44.02
\$ 51.00	\$ 34.36	\$ 60.55	\$ 55.76
\$ 79.50	\$ 52.26	\$ 69.75	\$ 70.44
\$ 98.40	\$ 62.32	\$ 89.80	\$ 85.11
\$ 156.00	\$101.34	\$103.95	\$ 99.78
\$ 180.00	\$115.44	\$119.25	\$ 111.52
\$ 204.00	\$131.60	\$260.78	\$ 129.13
\$ 276.00	\$183.22	\$307.50	\$ 143.81
\$ 322.50	\$218.74	\$335.40	\$ 173.15

\$41.25	\$27.22	\$54.45	\$50.98
\$53.25	\$36.68	\$66.65	\$64.58
\$82.50	\$54.54	\$76.75	\$81.57
\$105.90	\$64.98	\$98.80	\$98.57
\$162.00	\$104.34	\$114.35	\$115.56
\$187.50	\$118.62	\$131.20	\$129.15
\$210.00	\$135.18	\$273.80	\$149.55
\$288.00	\$187.12	\$322.90	\$166.54
\$403.50	\$277.88	\$352.20	\$200.53

2020 Seward County Culvert Bids

3" x 1" HELICAL with recorrugated ends

Size	Gage	<u>Ace/Eaton</u>	<u>M.C.I</u>	<u>Contech</u>	<u>Midwest</u>
		Price	Price	Price	Price
		Per foot	Per foot	Per foot	Per foot
60"	14	(12) \$96	\$ 61.88	\$ 56.95	No Bid
72"	12	\$ 339.00	\$ 101.60	\$ 93.50	No Bid
84"	12	(8) \$540	\$ 118.27	\$ 107.52	No Bid
96"	12	(8) \$600	\$ 134.94	\$ 123.48	No Bid
108"	10	(8) \$669	\$ 190.27	\$ 177.25	No Bid
120"	10	(8) \$735	\$ 211.20	\$ 197.75	No Bid

66x51	14	(12) \$106	\$ 64.25	\$ 59.85	No Bid
81x59	12	\$ 123.00	\$ 104.81	\$ 97.90	No Bid
95x67	12	(8) \$190	\$ 123.14	\$ 113.90	No Bid
112x75	12	(8) \$210	\$ 141.47	\$ 139.60	No Bid
128x83	10	(8) \$233	\$ 198.53	\$ 195.68	No Bid

142x91	10	(8) \$255	\$ 225.12	\$ 217.60	No Bid
--------	----	-----------	-----------	-----------	--------

<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price 2' band	<u>M.C.I.</u> Price 2' band	<u>Contech</u> Price 2' band	<u>Midwest</u> Price 2' band
(12) \$288	\$ 123.76	\$307.50	No Bid
\$ 339.00	\$ 203.20	\$335.40	No Bid
(8) \$540	\$ 236.54	\$422.80	No Bid
(8) \$600	\$ 269.88	\$437.75	No Bid
(8) \$669	\$ 380.54	\$448.65	No Bid
(8) \$735	\$ 422.40	\$498.85	No Bid

(12) \$318	\$ 128.50	\$322.90	No Bid
\$ 369.00	\$ 209.62	\$352.20	No Bid
(8) \$570	\$ 246.28	\$443.90	No Bid
(8) \$630	\$ 282.94	\$455.30	No Bid
(8) \$699	\$ 397.06	\$476.60	No Bid
(8) \$765	\$ 450.24	\$518.80	No Bid

2020 Seward County Culvert Bids

5" x 1" HELICAL with recorrugated ends

<u>Size</u>	<u>Gage</u>	<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price Per foot	<u>M.C.I.</u> Price Per foot	<u>Contech</u> Price Per foot	<u>Midwest</u> Price Per foot
60"	14	(10) \$97	\$ 54.45	\$ 49.60	\$ 66.69
60"	12	\$ 90.00	\$ 75.27	\$ 68.80	\$ 91.55
72"	12	\$ 107.00	\$ 89.41	\$ 81.40	\$ 109.64
72"	10	\$ 120.00	\$ 112.61	\$ 102.20	\$ 145.80
84"	12	(8) \$172	\$ 104.03	\$ 99.90	\$ 127.72
84"	10	\$ 153.00	\$ 131.04	\$ 127.90	\$ 163.89
96"	12	(8) \$194	\$ 118.76	\$ 116.70	\$ 146.94
96"	10	\$ 180.00	\$ 149.47	\$ 141.00	\$ 187.63
108"	10	\$ 205.00	\$ 167.42	\$ 158.30	\$ 210.24
108"	8	\$ 215.00	\$ 206.40	\$ 214.50	\$ 255.45
120"	10	\$ 224.00	\$ 185.86	\$ 177.90	\$ 232.84
120"	8	\$ 237.00	\$ 229.15	\$ 238.00	\$ 282.58

66x51	12	(10) \$103	\$77.42	\$72.50	\$ 95.67
81x59	12	(10) \$126	\$92.24	\$86.50	\$ 114.57
95x67	12	(8) \$180	\$108.32	\$116.60	\$ 133.46
95x67	10	\$161.00	\$135.46	\$148.50	\$ 171.26
112x75	12	(8) \$202	\$124.51	\$138.70	\$ 153.54
112x75	10	\$188.00	\$154.94	\$160.90	\$ 196.06
128x83	10	\$213.00	\$174.72	\$190.85	\$ 219.68
128x83	8	\$223.00	\$215.33	\$228.90	\$ 266.93
142x91	10	\$232.00	\$198.14	\$219.40	No Bid
142x91	8	\$245.00	\$244.22	\$252.20	\$ 295.28

<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price 2' band	<u>M.C.I.</u> Price 2' band	<u>Contech</u> Price 2' band	<u>Midwest</u> Price 2' band
(10) \$291	\$ 108.90	\$307.50	\$157.44

\$ 270.00	\$ 150.54	\$307.50	\$157.44
\$ 321.00	\$ 178.82	\$335.40	\$189.57
\$ 360.00	\$ 225.22	\$335.40	\$189.57
(8) \$516	\$ 208.06	\$422.80	\$266.69
\$ 459.00	\$ 262.08	\$422.80	\$266.69
(8) \$582	\$ 237.52	\$437.75	\$305.24
\$ 540.00	\$ 298.94	\$437.75	\$305.24
\$ 615.00	\$ 334.84	\$448.65	\$340.59
\$ 645.00	\$ 412.80	\$448.65	\$340.59
\$ 672.00	\$ 371.72	\$498.85	\$520.52
\$ 711.00	\$ 458.30	\$498.85	\$520.52

(10) \$309	\$154.84	\$322.90	\$182.33
(10) \$378	\$184.48	\$352.20	\$219.54
(8) \$540	\$216.64	\$443.90	\$308.85
\$483.00	\$270.92	\$443.90	\$308.85
(8) \$606	\$249.02	\$455.30	\$353.50
\$564.00	\$309.88	\$455.30	\$353.50
\$639.00	\$349.44	\$476.60	\$394.44
\$669.00	\$430.66	\$476.60	\$394.44
\$696.00	\$396.28	\$518.80	No Bid
\$735.00	\$488.44	\$518.80	\$602.82

2020 Seward County Culvert Bids

END SECTIONS

Size	Gage	<u>Ace/Eaton</u> Price	<u>M.C.I.</u> Price	<u>Contech</u> Price	<u>Midwest</u> Price
18"	16	\$100.00	\$77.75	\$85.80	\$108.00
24"	16	\$140.00	\$115.95	\$123.75	\$162.96
30"	14	\$275.00	\$198.60	\$271.60	\$322.32
36"	14	\$375.00	\$319.60	\$324.85	\$438.96
42"	12	\$600.00	\$680.15	\$486.30	\$881.16
48"	12	\$700.00	\$776.90	\$536.60	\$1,026.96
54"	12	\$875.00	\$955.50	\$566.30	\$1,189.80
60"	12	\$1,200.00	\$1,433.25	\$752.40	\$1,745.16
72"	12	\$1,475.00	\$1,708.00	\$995.50	\$2,081.16

21x15	16	\$95.00	\$60.90	\$98.70	\$84.00
28x20	16	\$130.00	\$87.25	\$142.30	\$118.32
35x24	14	\$220.00	\$162.80	\$298.80	\$198.96
42x29	14	\$350.00	\$241.75	\$357.40	\$313.80
49x33	12	\$375.00	\$434.70	\$534.95	\$540.00
57x58	12	\$675.00	\$621.10	\$589.60	\$673.80
64x43	12	\$925.00	\$863.55	\$647.80	\$936.00
71x47	12	\$1,150.00	\$1,128.70	\$823.20	\$1,374.96
83x57	12	\$1,425.00	\$1,624.40	\$988.70	\$2,461.80

Affirmative Vote: Paulsen, Schmieding, Vrbka, Mundhenke, Culver

Motion Carried

Moved by Paulsen and seconded by Vrbka to accept the following bids for rock and gravel as recommended by the Highway Supt.

BIDDERS	Johnson Sand & Gravel	Beatrice Sand & Gravel
PIT PRICE	\$ 11.50	\$ 13.15
DELIVERED		
A	\$ 20.43	
B	\$ 19.38	
C	\$ 18.70	
D	\$ 17.60	
E	\$ 18.70	
F	\$ 19.78	
G	\$ 20.68	
H	\$ 21.76	
I	\$ 22.52	
J	\$ 21.35	
K	\$ 20.37	
L	\$ 20.42	
M	\$ 20.60	
N	\$ 21.76	
O	\$ 22.38	
P	\$ 23.57	
PIT LOCATION	10 miles N, 2 W of Shelby	

3A Delivered	
MISSILE BASE	\$ 19.50

Affirmative Vote: Paulsen, Vrbka, Mundhenke, Schmieding, Culver

Motion Carried

Chelsea Smith from the Sheriff's Office was present to discuss an invoice from Accurate Controls for 200 key cards for the Justice Center. She stated it was the least number of cards they could order and since they are for the whole Justice Center, she felt that it should not come out of the Sheriff's Office budget. The Commissioners will see about paying it out of the Building and Grounds Dept.

Commissioners Reports:

Commissioner Mundhenke reported he checked on roads. He also was going to meet with some constituents about closing the railroad crossing North of Milford.

Commissioner Vrbka reported he attended an Upper Big Blue meeting and dealt with various road situations.

Commissioner Culver reported he participated in some Blue Valley Community Action surveys online, worked on Seward/Saline Solid Waste Agency items, met with a constituent on a road issue, and dealt with various correspondences.

Commissioner Schmieding reported he met with the Visitors Committee and received a constituent concern about surveyor's nails in the road. He reported he also dealt with various correspondences.

Commissioner Paulsen reported she attended a BRIDGES meeting.

Moved by Vrbka and seconded by Mundhenke to approve the Surplus Property Disposal Request from the County Treasurer.

Affirmative Vote: Vrbka, Mundhenke, Schmieding, Paulsen, Culver Motion Carried

Moved by Vrbka and seconded by Mundhenke to accept the Annual Return of Disposed Items from Detention Center.

Affirmative Vote: Vrbka, Mundhenke, Paulsen, Schmieding, Culver Motion Carried

Moved by Paulsen and seconded by Vrbka to authorize the Chairman sign a letter to Nebraska Emergency Management Agency appointing Gary Peterson as authorized representative for Federal Disaster 4521.

Affirmative Vote: Paulsen, Vrbka, Schmieding, Mundhenke, Culver Motion Carried

The Commissioners started budget meeting with officials. The first to have their meeting was Wendy Elston, County Attorney.

The next official meeting with the Commissioners was Ann Dobesh who represented the Extension Office.

The Commissioners recessed at 11:08 a.m.

The Commissioners re-convened at 11:10 a.m.

Brea Ehman, HR Director for Seward County, was next to visit with the Board to discuss her office budget.

Gary Petersen, Emergency Manager, was present to discuss his budget.

The Commissioners recessed at 11:30 a.m.

The Commissioners re-convened at 11:32 a.m.

Commissioner Paulsen asked to be removed from the Board at 11:32 a.m.

Becky Paulsen, Weed/Zoning Administrator, discussed her budget with the Commissioners.

Commissioner Paulsen re-joined the Board at 11:46 a.m.

Eric Hofer, Building and Grounds Supt., was next to discuss his budget with the Commissioners.

The Commissioners recessed at 12:00 p.m.

The Commissioners re-convened at 1:01 p.m.

Kathy Ruzicka, Seward County Aging Services Director, and Randy Jones from Aging Partners were present to discuss the Aging Services budget and also the amount Seward County owes to Lincoln/Lancaster Aging Services. They are the entity that receives grants on behalf of Seward County.

Sherry Schweitzer, County Clerk, went through her budgets and other miscellaneous budgets.

The Commissioners recessed at 2:52

The Commissioners re-convened at 3:01 p.m.

Known items on the agenda for Board of Commissioners on August 4, 2020 are as follows:

9:00 a.m.

1. Convene and announce Open Meetings Law
2. Pledge of Allegiance
3. Discuss/Action - Public/Officials/Boards
4. Discuss/Action - Approve minutes of July 28, 2020
5. Discuss/Action – Claims for the period through July 24, 2020

Other Business Matters to Address When Time Allows

6. Commissioners Reports
7. Discuss/Action – Authorize Chairman to sign Agreement with the Lancaster Youth Services Center for Juvenile Detention Services
8. Discuss/Action – Agenda for August 11, 2020

9:15 a.m. Discuss/Action – Leonard Wasserman & others – Drainage on Road in Grover Problem

10:00 a.m. Discuss/Action – Budget Discussion/Meeting with Officials

Moved by Vrbka and seconded by Schmieding to adjourn at 3:30 p.m.

Affirmative Vote: Vrbka, Schmieding, Paulsen, Mundhenke, Culver Motion Carried

State of Nebraska)
County of Seward) ss.

I, Sherry Schweitzer, the undersigned County Clerk of Seward County, Nebraska do hereby certify the foregoing minutes are true and are part of the official records of this office.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal this 4th day of August 2020.

County Clerk

Chairman